Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC

July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 1
¢7;\\\{ Formatted: Not Different first page header ]
Article 6 /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
RESIDENTIAL CODE® = \ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
7-6-1: ADOPTION: : ’ ‘{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
7-6-2: AMENDMENTS: “_{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
7-6-1: ADOPTION: @ = Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial

Al The 2009-2018 International residential code (28689-2018 IRC) as published by the Internat\i
Code Council, is hereby adopted by the Village by reference and is made a part hereof as\,zi
fully set forth in this section with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes set forth ﬁ
section 7-6-2 of this article. To the extent that the provisions of the IRC are inconsistent wi
any codes previously adopted by the Village by reference, the provisions of the 2009 IRC\ i
govern unless specifically set forth in this code. In the event of a conflict between any \ \\\\\ Underline, Font color: Red
provisions of the IRC and any provision of the Oak Park Village Code, the provisions of the \\\
Oak Park Village Code shall govern. \\ \
\\\\ \ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt,
Underlme

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

\[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

\ [Formatted No underline, Font color: Auto

\\{Formatted Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

\
Formatted Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt,
Underline, Font color: Red

7-6-2: AMENDMENTS:; ¥ =1 \

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

{Formatted Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

The 2009-2018 international residential code, as adopted pursuant to section 7-6-1 of this \\ | Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

article, is hereby amended by adding the underlined language and deleting the overstrické

\
{Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

language as follows: N\\s \ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

\\\ \ \ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

CHAPTER 1 \\\\ [Formatted. Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION \\\\\ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt,
\\ \ Underline, Font color: Red

PART +1 - SCOPE AND APPLICATION \\{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
{Formatted Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

SECTION R101 - GENERAL

(Formatted. Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Section R101.1 Title. These regulations, as amended and adopted by the Village of Oak Par
shall be known as the residential code of the Village of Oak Park, hereinafter referred to as
"this code."

SECTION R102 - APPLICABILITY

Section 102.5 Appendices. Provisions-in-the-appendices-shall-notapplyunless-specifically
referenced-inthe-adopting-oerdirance: Adopted as part of this code are:

L Appendix A - Sizes-Sizing And Capacities Of Gas Piping; /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt ]



http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?chapter_id=20331#s1016165
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?chapter_id=20331#s1016166
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?ft=3&find=7-6-2
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?ft=3&find=7-6-1
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?chapter_id=20331#20331
mailto:?subject=Oak Park Code Regulations&body=Below is a link to the Village code which contains the information you requested.

http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/index.php?book_id%3D459%26chapter_id%3D20331
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?chapter_id=20331#1016165
mailto:?subject=Oak Park Code Regulations&body=Below is a link to the Village code which contains the information you requested.

http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/index.php?book_id%3D459%26chapter_id%3D20331#s1016165
http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/getBookData.php?chapter_id=20331#1016166
mailto:?subject=Oak Park Code Regulations&body=Below is a link to the Village code which contains the information you requested.

http://www.sterlingcodifiers.com/codebook/index.php?book_id%3D459%26chapter_id%3D20331#s1016166

Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 2

2. Appendix B - Sizing Of Venting Systems Serving Appliances Equipped With Draft Hoods,
Category 1 Appliances, And Appliances Listed For Use With Type B Vents;

3. Appendix C - Exit Terminals Of Mechanical Draft And Direct-Vent Venting Systems;

4. Appendix D - Recommended Procedure For Safety Inspection Of An Existing Appliance
Installation;

5. Appendix F - Radon Control Methods, as amended hereinafter;

6. Appendix G - Piping Standards for Various Applications Swimming-Peels Spas-And-Het —{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Fubs;

7. Appendix H - Patio Covers;

(o]

. Appendix J - Existing Buildings And Structures;

9. Appendix K - Sound Transmission, and

10. Appendix M - Home Day Care - R-3 Occupancy.

APART H—g‘_- ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT [ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

\""[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

CHAPTER 1, PART #-2 - ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT is deleted in its entirety | rormatted: Font: (vefautty Ava, 12

o

and replaced with the following:

CHAPTER 1, PART #-2 - ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT { Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Administration and enforcement of this code shall be governed by applicable provisions of
chapter 1 of the international building code as amended and adopted by the Village.

[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

‘CHAPTER 3
BUILDING PLANNING

SECTION R301 - DESIGN CRITERIA

TABLE R301.2(1) CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA is modified to read as
follows:

TABLE R301.2(1)
Climatic And Geographic Design Criteria

Ground snow load: 36-25 @ ///*{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
Wind design speed: 98-115 mph /,,,//{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Topographic effects: No
Seismic design category: B
Weathering: Severe




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 3

Frost depth line: 42 inches

Termites: Moderate to heavy

Winter design temperature: -4°F, 97.5%
Summer design temperature: 89°F dry bulb, 2.5%; 76°F wet bulb, 2.5%
Ice barrier underlayment required: Yes
Flood hazards: No

Air freezing index: 1543 (°F-Days)
Annual mean temperature: 49.4°F
Heating degree days (HDD): 6,155
Cooling degree days (CDD): 942
Climate zone: 5A

Heating maximum: 72°F

Cooling minimum: 75°F

100-year hourly rainfall rate: 4 inches

{ Formatted:

Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

: Winter Summer : desian
Lattitude > - correction lemperatu
heating cooling factor tenpratur [& cooling

Elevation
é@@m - n Coinciden Daily Winter Summer
| difference

[Heitzman note: Commissioner James Johnson agreed at our last meeting to fill out this table
for inclusion in the IRC 2018]

. //{ Formatted:

color: Red

Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Font

TABLE R301.5 MINIMUM UNIFORMLY DISTRIBUTED LIVE LOADS

Add the following to the use Balconies (exterior) and decks:

Horizontal Live Load: 10 psf applied parallel and perpendicular to the joist span on all
horizontal occupiable surfaces, including but not limited to built-in seating areas, stairs
and walking surfaces for exterior balconies and free-standing decks.

Formatted:

Exceptions:

1. Free standing decks whose occupiabe surface is 36" or less from the grade plane. _—{ Formatted: Font: Italic ]

2. Compliance with the anchorage requirements of Section R507 is acceptable in lieu

of desiqninq for Horizontal Live Load . //[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Bold J

N ///{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt ]

% ,/—//[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Bold ]
)

Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 4

TABLE R302.1(1) ~_—{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt ]
EXTERIOR WALLS

/{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt ]




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 5

/{ Formatted: Font: 12 pt




Article 6 Residential Code

Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC

July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 6
‘TAB LE R302.1(1) ////{ Formatted: Font: 12 pt
EXTERIOR WALLS
. ////[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
R MINIMUM MINIMUM | Formatted: Font: 12 pt
EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT FIRE RESISTANCE RATING FIRE SEPARATION
DISTANCE
N Fire resistance 1 hour—tested in accordance 0 feet | Formatted: Font: 12 pt
Walls rated with
ASTM E119 or UL263
or Section 703.3 of the
International Building Code
with
exposure from both sides
Not fire resistance 0 hours > 53 feet
rated
R Not allowed N/A <21foot | Formatted: Font: 12 pt
Projections Fire resistance 1 hour on the underside, or = 2 feetl foot to < 5-2
rated heavy timber, or fire-retardant- feet
treated wood *°
rated retardant treated framing-and
deeking
Not fire resistance 0 hours =52 feet
rated
R Not allowed N/A <3feet | Formatted: Font: 12 pt
Openings in 25% maximum of 0 hours 3-feet< 5 feet
walls wall area
Unlimited 0 hours 5 feet
Penetrations All Comply with Section R302.4 < 3 feet __—| Formatted: Font: 12 pt
None required 3 feet
. ////[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
a. The fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to 0 hours on the _{ Formatted: Font: 12 pt
underside of the eave pverhang jf fireblocking is provided from the wall top plate to the w{mmaﬁed: Font: 12 pt, Not Bold
underside of the roof sheathing. Formatted: Font: 12 pt
b. The fire-resistance rating shall be permitted to be reduced to 0 hours on the Formatted: Font: 12 pt, Not Bold
underside of the rake overhang where gable vent openings are not installed.,
Formatted: Font: 12 pt
Formatted: Font: 12 pt, Not Bold
Formatted: Font: 12 pt
Formatted: Font: 12 pt, Not Bold
Formatted: Font: 12 pt
\[Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Section R302.12 Draftstopping.

| Add the following exception:

/{ Formatted:

Font:

(Default) Arial, 12 pt

(N N W W W W | W N N




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 7

Exception: Draftstopping is not required in buildings equipped throughout with an automatic—{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

sprinkler system in accordance with section P2904. NFPA 13, NFPA 13R or NFPA 13D as

approved by the puilding official, - Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Italic

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Italic
: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

N /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

SECTION R313 - AUTOMATIC FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

Section R313.2 One- And Two-Family Dwellings Automatic Fire Systems. An automatic—{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in new construction of one- and two-family

dwellings.

Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required for ~{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

additions or alterations to existing buildings that are not already provided with an

automatic residential sprinkler system. Existing one- and two-family dwellings where

more than 50% of the habitable floor area above the foundation level is demolished and

rebuilt shall be provided with an automatic fire sprinkler system throughout the dwelling.

. Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

ASECT|ON R314 - SMOKE ALARMS /{Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Section R314.1.1 Listings. Smoke alarms shall be listed in accordance with UL 217.

Combination smoke and carbon monoxide alarms shall be listed in accordance with UL

217 and UL 2034. The alarm system shall not be dependent upon a subscription-based —{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

service to provide the level of notification intended by the provisions of this code. No
provision of this code shall be construed to override any more-restrictive provision of
other applicable laws and ordinances.




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 8

R314.3 Location. |n new construction or where renovation or addition work requiring a —{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

permit occurs in existing buildings, sSmoke alarms shall be installed in the following
locations:

1. In each sleeping room.

2. Outside each separate sleeping area within 15 feet of in-the-immediate-vicinity-ofthe —{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

AdOOF to every bedrooms. /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

3. On each additional story of the dwelling, including basements and habitable attics
and not including crawl spaces and uninhabitable attics. In dwellings or dwelling units
with split levels and without an intervening door between the adjacent levels, a smoke
alarm installed on the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level provided that
the lower level is less than one full story below the upper level.

4. Smoke alarms shall be installed not less than 3 feet (914 mm) horizontally from the
door or opening of a bathroom that contains a bathtub or shower unless this would
prevent placement of a smoke alarm required by this section.

5. In open floor plan areas, within 15 feet of the location used for sleeping purposes; ~_—{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

6. In occupiable spaces of accessory structures, other than those used for vehicle or ~{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

general storage. When occupiable space, other than that used for vehicle or general /{Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

storage, is constructed or altered in an accessory structure, an approved smoke alarm
shall be installed on each level of the structure. The smoke alarm(s) shall be hard-wire

connected to a smoke alarm located within the primary structure on site. Physical _{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
interconnection of smoke alarms shall not be required where listed wireless alarms are
installed and all alarms sound upon activation of one alarm, __—{ Formatted: Font: (Defautt) Arial, 12 pt

/{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

ASECTION R315 - CARBON MONOXIDE ALARMS

R315.1.1 Listings. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be listed in accordance with UL
2034. Combination carbon monoxide and smoke alarms shall be listed in accordance
with UL 2034 and UL 217. The alarm system shall not be dependent upon a
subscription-based service to provide the level of notification intended by the provisions
of this code. No provision of this code shall be construed to override any more-
restrictive provision contained in any other law or ordinance.

R315.3 Location. Carbon monoxide alarms in dwelling units shall be installed outside
of each separate sleeping area in-the-immediate-vicinity-of the-bedrooms within 15 feet
of the bedroom door, or in the case of an open floor plan, within 15 feet of the location
used for sleeping purposes. Where a fuel-burning appliance is located within a bedroom
or its attached bathroom, a carbon monoxide alarm shall be installed within the
bedroom.




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 9

315.3.1, Where occupiable space is constructed or altered in an accessory structure an __—{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

approved carbon monoxide alarm shall be installed in each occupiable space other than Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

space used for vehicle or general storage. The carbon monoxide alarm(s) shall be hard- Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

)

wire connected to a carbon monoxide alarm located within the primary structure on site.
Physical interconnection of smoke alarms shall not be required where listed wireless

alarms are installed and all alarms sound upon activation of one alarm, _{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

k"[ Formatted: Indent: Left: 0"

SECTION R321 - ELEVATORS AND PLATFORM LIFTS

o J

R321.1 Elevators. Where provided, passenger elevators, limited-use and limited- ~{ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

application elevators or private residence elevators shall comply with ASME-ALZL/CSA

B44-the current provisions of the state of lllinois safety codes and standards for { Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

conveyances., /{ Formatted: Font: 12 pt

R321.2 Platform lifts. Where provided, platform lifts shall comply with ASME-A18-1 the Formatted: Indent: Left: 0", Right: 0", Don't

current provisions of the state of lllinois safety codes and standards for conveyances., g‘g:itafj‘jsgf;ztrfggt@f;i\"s‘l’aﬁst':;‘t‘;:;
numbers

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

(N N

and—aap%able—law& /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

CHAPTER 4
FOUNDATIONS

SECTION R401 - GENERAL

Section R401.4.1 Geotechnical Evaluation. lnlieu-of a-complete-geotechnical-evaluation;
the-load-bearing-values-intable- R401.4.1 shall be-assumed: Unless proven otherwise by
submittal of a complete geotechnical soils evaluation of the soils at the site, the maximum
load-bearing capacity of foundation materials shall be assumed to be 1,500 pounds per square
foot. Where the building official determines that in-place soils with an allowable bearing
capacity of less than 1,500 pounds per square foot are likely to be present at the site, the
allowable bearing capacity shall be determined by a geotechnical soils evaluation.

TABLE R401.4.1 shall be deleted in its entirety.



Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 10

SECTION R403 - FOOT|NGSA 4/—‘[Forma‘cted: Indent: Left: 0"

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Section R403.1.4 Minimum Depth. All exterior footings shall be placed at least £2-14 inch Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

£3065-mm) below the undisturbed ground surface. Where applicable, the depth of footings shall
also conform to sections R403.1.4.1 through R403.1.4.2.




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 11




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 12

CHAPTER 11
ENERGY EFFICIENCY

Chapter 11 - ENERGY EFFICIENCY is deleted in its entirety.

/{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

‘CHAPTER 13
GENERAL MECHANICAL SYSTEM REQUIREMENTS

SECTION M1303 - LABELING OF APPLIANCES

Add the following new paragraph:

/{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Section M1303.21 2 Manufacturer's Data Sheets. In lieu of providing a label as required by{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

section M1303.1 the manufacturer's product data sheets may be provided in a permanent
protective sleeve located on or near the appliance.




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 13

pasteach-side-of the ductforthe fulllength-of the duct:

/{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

‘CHAPTER 14
HEATING AND COOLING EQUIPMENT

. /{ Formatted:

Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
SECTION M1411 - HEATING AND COOLING EQUIPMENT < Formatted: Indent: Left: 0"
Section M1411.2 Refrigeration Coils In Warm-Air Furnaces. Where a cooling coil is located
in the supply plenum of a warm-air furnace, the furnace blower shall be rated at not less than
0.5-inch water column (124 Pa) static pressure at the required airflow for the associated /{Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
cooling coil (NEC), unless the furnace is listed and labeled for use with a cooling coil. Cooling—{ Formatted: Font: (Defautt) Arial, 12 pt
coils shall not be located upstream from heat exchangers unless listed and labeled for such
use. Conversion of existing furnaces for use with cooling coils shall be permitted provided the
furnace will operate within the temperature rise specified for the furnace.
Section M1411.3 Condensate Disposal. Condensate from all cooling coils or evaporators
shall be conveyed from the drain pan outlet to an approved place of disposal. Such piping shall
maintain a minimum horizontal slope in the direction of discharge of not less than /g unit
vertical in 12 units horizontal (1-percent slope). Condensate drain lines or piping associated
with permanently installed equipment or appliances shall not discharge inte-a-streetalley-or —{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
otherareas-where-itwould-cause-a-puisance fo the exterior through the building envelope. —{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
. /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
CHAPTER 15
EXHAUST SYSTEMS

Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt,

SECTION M1503 - RANGE HOODS DOMESTIC COOKING EXHAUST EQUIPMENT /{Formatted:

Strikethrough




Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
Page 14

Article 6 Residential Code
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups

Add the following new paragraph:

/{ Formatted: Font:

(Default) Arial, 12 pt

Section M1503.6.3 Makeup Air Temperature. The temperature differential between make/LLB‘{Formatted: Font:

air and the air in the conditioned space shall not exceed 10°F except where the added heatingl.cer: Red

(Default) Arial, 12 pt, Font

and cooling loads of the makeup air do not exceed the capacity of the HVAC system.

‘t Formatted: Font:

(Default) Arial, 12 pt

GHARPTER 16

Strikethrough

Formatted: Font:

(Default) Arial, 12 pt,

Strikethrough

Formatted: Font:

(Default) Arial, 12 pt,

Formatted: Font:

(Default) Arial, 12 pt,

Strikethrough

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt,
Strikethrough

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt,
Strikethrough

* \[ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

CHARTER 18 Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
b A Bold
A A .

: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not

\£ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
\E : Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
Bold

|

ik

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
Bold

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

h/ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
athod

fal
A=

Bold
RetA
\L Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

o G JC A G G A N A A JC U A A




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC

July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 15

- J

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
Bold
Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
H Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
Bold
Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
Bold
Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
ACHAF’TER 23 /{Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
SOLAR THERMAL ENERGY SYSTEMS
SECTION M2301 - SOLAR THERMAL AENERGY SYSTEMS /{Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
Section M2301.2 Design and installation. The design and installation of solar energy Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not
systems shall comply with Sections M2301.2.1 through M2301.2.9-13 and the 209&2017,\[ Bold
national electric code as amended and adopted by the Village. Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
Section M2301.5 Backflow Prevention. Connections from the potable water supply to solar
energy systems shall comply with seetion-P29082.5-5-the state of Illinois plumbing code. /{Formaned: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

N o N

CHAPTER 24 *”‘[ Formatted:

Indent: Left: 0"




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 16

TABLE G417 711 4’——[Formatted: Indent: Left: 0"




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 17

luiaE Formatted: Indent: Left: 0" ]




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 18

SECTION G2455 FLUE LINERS is added as follows:

SECTION G2455 /{ Formatted: No underline

FLUE LINERS /{Formatted: No underline

Section G2455.1 Retrofit Flue Liners. Retrofit flue liners shall conform to the manufacturer's —{ Formatted: No underline

written instructions, this code and sections G2454.1.1 and G2454.1.2.

Section G2455.1.1 Flexible Flue Liners. Flexible flue liners shall conform to the manufacturer's Formatted: No underline

written instructions, this code and sections G2454.1.1.1 through G2454.1.1.3.

Section G2455.1.1.1 Attachment. Flexible flue liners shall be firmly attached at the top of the
chimney in accordance with the manufacturer's written instructions. In the absence of
manufacturer's written instructions, the upper termination of the liner shall be adequately
supported and attached with a minimum of three corrosion-resistant fasteners made of
material(s) compatible with all materials in contact thereto. The attachment(s) shall be
adequate to support the entire flue liner in the chimney.

Section G2455.1.1.2 Transition Between Horizontal And Vertical. Flexible flue liners shall not
be utilized to transition between horizontal and vertical sections of the flue liner.

Section G2455.1.1.3 Prohibited Installations. Flexible flue liners shall not be utilized in
conjunction with solid fuel-burning appliances unless specifically listed and labeled for such
use.

Section G2455.1.2 Chimney Connection. A flue liner shall be connected by one of the methods
prescribed below:

Section G2455.1.2.1 Capped Tee. A capped tee shall be installed at the bottom of the flue —{ Formatted: No underiine

liner. The tee stem shall look out toward the appliance connection, the capped end shall be
located at the bottom of the vertical length of the flue liner.

Section G2455.1.2.2 Elbow And Capped Tee. Where it is not possible to install a capped tee in
conformance with section G2454.1.2.1, the transition from the vertical length of flue liner to the
horizontal length shall be made with a securely attached elbow. A cleanout shall be provided
by installing a capped tee in the connector next to the chimney. The capped end of the tee
stem shall face downward. The cap shall include provisions for drainage.

Section G2455.1.2.3 Other Approved Method. This section is not intended to prevent the use{ Formatted: No underiine

of any material, method of construction, design or system not specifically prescribed herein,
provided that such construction, design or system has been approved by the building official as
meeting the intent of this code.

N /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
A /{ Formatted: Font: Not Bold
CHAPTER 25 PLUMBING ADMINISTRATION is deleted in its entirety. _—{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

)




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 19

CHAPTER 26
GENERAL PLUMBING REQUIREMENTS

SECTION P2601 - GENERAL

Sectlon P2601 1 Scope Iheuprewaen&ef—tl%chac&e#sha#qe&%ﬁh&ms&%aﬂeﬁe#

ode: The provisions Of/the{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

current edltlon of the state of III|n0|s plumbing code shall qovern the erection, installation,
alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing

equipment and systems. , /{Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Sewer and Water Service to be Provided. All new one or two-family dwellings shall provide
the following;

New sewer service from the principle structure to the Village sewer main in street.
Over-head sewer system in buildings with basements.

New water service from the principle structure to the Village main.

New water meter, purchased from Village.

g |@ N =

1 + Numbering Style: 1, 2, 3, ... + Start at: 1 +
Alignment: Left + Aligned at: 0" + Indent at:

New Buffalo box water shut off valve in parkway, purchased from Village. - Formatted: List Paragraph, Numbered + Level:
0.25"

Section P2601.3 Flood Hazard Area is deleted in its entirety.

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Indent: Left: 0"

Sections P2602, Individual Water Supply And Sewage Disposal, through section P2608
P2609 Materials Evaluation And Listing, inclusive, are all deleted in their entirety.

Chapter 27 Plumbing Fixtures,

Chapter 28 Water Heaters,

Chapter 29 Water Supply And Distribution,
Chapter 30 Sanitary Drainage,

Chapter 31 Vents, and

Chapter 32 Traps are all deleted in their entirety.



Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 20

CHAPTER 33
STORM DRAINAGE

Chapter 33 STORM DRAINAGE is deleted in its entirety and replaced with chapter 11 of the

2018 International Plumbing Code, appended to this code and re-titled Chapter 33 Storm _—{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Drainage.

CHAPTER 34
GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

SECTION E3401 - GENERAL

alleweel—bv—tmgeede—Thls chapter governs the eIectrlcaI components equmment and svstems

used in or on buildings, structures, and properties governed by this code. Electrical
components, equipment, and systems shall be designed and constructed in accordance with
the provisions of the national electric code, NFPA 70 as amended and adopted by the Village.

Sections E3401.2 Scope, E3401.3 Not Covered and E3401.4 Additions and Alterations —{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

are deleted in their entirety.
SECTION E3402 BUILDING STRUCTURE PROTECTION is deleted in its entirety.
SECTION E3403 - INSPECTION AND APPROVAL

Sections E3403.1 Approval and E3403.3 Listing and labeling are deleted in their entirety.

Sectlon E3403 2 Inspectlons Requwed New—eleetneal—werle%d—saﬁ&ef_exlsﬂﬂq—svstems

eemplanee—m{hm&mqmmentsﬂf_ehamepsﬁﬂ—ﬂ%aqh% Anv electncal work performe Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

where a permit is required to do the work shall be inspected by the building official to ensure
compliance with this code. Any electrical work that will be concealed shall be inspected and
approved before being concealed. Work inspected and approved shall not be modified without
obtaining a subsequent approval after the modification. The building official may require any
equipment, component, or panelboard, or access to these elements to be opened for

inspection. The building official may require any project related personnel to be on site for any{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

inspection, including, but not limited to property owners, design professionals, general
contractor and/or sub-contractor representatives or owners.

Safe access shall be provided to all areas required for inspection. The building official reserves
the right to not perform any inspection where safe access is not provided, including but not
necessarily limited to, trenches, ladders, temporary stairs, quardrails, areas requiring the




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 21

removal of safety equipment such as boots or hard hats, and/or manholes or vaults. Where
specialty safety equipment is required to perform an inspection, it shall be provided for the
inspector to use for the inspection, by a responsible party to the construction project.

The property owner shall ultimately be responsible for assuring that all the required inspections
are approved.

/{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Sections E3404 - GENERAL EQUIPMENT REQUIREMENTS; E3405 - EQUIPMENT
LOCATION AND CLEARANCES; E3406 - ELECTRICAL CONDUCTORS AND
CONNECTIONS, and E3407 CONDUCTOR AND TERMINAL IDENTIFICATION are deleted
in their entirety.

Chapter 35 Electrical Definitions,

Chapter 36 Services,

Chapter 37 Branch Circuit And Feeder Requirements,

Chapter 38 Wiring Methods,

Chapter 39 Power And Lighting Distribution,

Chapter 40 Devices And Luminaires,

Chapter 41 Appliance Installation,

Chapter 42 Swimming Pools, and

Chapter 43 Class 2 Remote-Control, Signaling And Power-Limited Circuits are all deleted
in their entirety.

APPEN DIX F /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

RADON CONTROL METHODSA /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

SECTION AF101 - SCOPE
Appendix F section AF101.1 General. Fhis-appendix-containsrequirementsfornew

construction-in-jurisdictions-where radonresistantconstruction-isrequired: Where installed, —( Formatted: Font: (Default) Aria, 12 pt

radon control methods shall be in accordance with this appendix unless superseded by state

requirements, /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

A /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

+)=| Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

) )

APPENDIX J /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES
SECTION AJ102 - COMPLIANCE

Appendix J sections AJ102.10 and AJ102.11 are added as follows:

Section AJ102.10 Conversion Into Habitable Space. When any area not previously
approved or utilized as habitable space is converted into and/or utilized as habitable space,




Article 6 Residential Code Oak Park Amendments to the 2018 IRC
July 23, 2019 Heitzman Markups Page 22

regardless of the amount of construction work done in this area, it shall be considered as
reconstruction and shall be subject to the requirements of this appendix and the provisions of
section R310 of this code.

Section AJ102.11 Conversion Into A Sleeping Room. When any area not previously
approved or utilized as a sleeping room is converted into and/or utilized as a sleeping room,
regardless of the amount of construction work that was or was not done in this conversion or
change of utilization, it shall be subject to all requirements for new construction of a sleeping
room as found in this code.

http://sterlingcodifiers Formatted: Hyperlink, Font: (Default) Arial, 12
pt, Not Hidden

A

_ [ Field code Changed

AJ102.12 Adding Insulation to Existing Attics Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt

Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt, Not

Whenever the total R value of existing plus proposed insulation to be added to the floor Hidden

- JU

of an existing attic exceeds R25 ( Fitw) haxBuilding Permit shall be required Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt
and a licensed design professional shall submit evidence of the structural adequacy of

the existing roof framing (rafters, joists, ridge beams and their connections, as

applicable) based on the snow load design provisions of the International Residential

Code, or the International Building Code, as currently adopted, including

amendments. Where the existing framing cannot be shown to comply with the current

design snow load requirements, such framing, including connections, shall be

appropriately reinforced using construction details prepared by a licensed design

professional. The same requirements shall apply when insulation in excess of R25 is

applied between the rafters of a ventilated roof.

. /{ Formatted: Font: (Default) Arial, 12 pt



http://sterlingcodifiers/

